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S. No. Feedback Action Taken 

1. Course contents should be revised with 
involvement of students.  Unnecessary contents 
/topics should be deleted or modified; as there is 
a lot of repetition of such topics.  Appropriate 
paper should be introduced into the syllabus for 
the students of other courses entering in the 
department of Biochemistry through entrance 
mode.  Academic burden should be reduced in 
semester III and IV; as it is crucial for 
competitive exams. Add subjects from other 
department. (eg. Genetics). Only one seminar 
paper in first semester.  Seminars should be 
given according to lab work.  Some of the course 
with overlapping syllabi can be merged. For eg. 
Cell biology and cell signaling can be merged into 
one. Microbiology should rather be covered in 
earlier semester whereas Bioinformatics should 
be covered in 3rd Semester. As far syllabus of 
biochemistry is concerned, syllabus is being 
covered widely and taught practical aspects but 
there should be more emphasis on theoretical 
things also, in details. There could be addition of 
genetics and most important subject should be 
less in last semester.  Bioinformatics practical 
can also be included.  More emphasis should be 
given on the recent advancements in our field. 
Student should not be under so much pressure 
that the freedom to think and do research 
independently is affected. Rest practical 
exposure is very good. 

The syllabus is being 

revised keeping in 

consideration the feedback.  

It is expected to be 

implemented from July 

2018. We will have 

extensive student-teacher 

interactions and the 

feasibility of suggestions 

being incorporated will be 

discussed in details and 

appropriate measure will be 

taken.  

2. Saturday should be given as an “off” day as 
already done in colleges.  Gazetted off & winter 
vacation should be given. 

The syllabus is being 

revised to have open 

elective courses on 

Saturdays.  This will enable 

students to finish classes 

early.Classes are suspended 

during vacations, breaks 

and holidays.   

3. Less PPT’s should be given as it leads to more 
pressure.  There should be less pressure on 
students (of multiple seminars, internal tests, 
assignment) during course of study.   

Tests and assignments are 

given to enable revision and 

for internal assessment. 

Student presentations are 

useful for their learning 

process, while also 

improving their oratory 



S. No. Feedback Action Taken 

skills and public speaking 

ability.  In case of any 

lacunae, we will make 

improvements. 

4. Fourth semester should be devoid of any 
theoretical subjects or at maximum can have two 
theories not more than that. 

In the revised syllabus, the 

number of courses is being 

reduced in the fourth 

semester to allow more time 

for dissertation. 

5. There should be more exposure in terms of 
internships and job opportunities. 

Students opt forsummer 

internships in research 

institutes.  We will try to 

help them in this. 

6. Result should be given on time. We will try to announce 

results within 30 days of the 

last day of exam as also 

prescribed by Internal 

Quality Assurance Cell.  

7. Hostel facility should be given to all.  There 
should be allotment of hostel to the local 
resident people also. 

The Department has written 

to the University for 

looking into this for 

necessary action as long 

back as when the semester 

system of teaching was 

introduced.  

8. There should be more Inter University events so 
that we can have more experience and develop 
other skills. 

Educational trips/ 

excursions have already 

been introduced in the 

department to allow inter-

institute interaction.  

Further, University 

organizes many events in 

sports and academics at 

national level. 

9. The students should be provided with Wi-Fi 
facility in the department 

The Department will write 

to the University for 

allotting each student Wi-Fi 

password and internet 

service on campus. 

 


